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Editorial
Awareness of Chronic Kidney Disease: Bangladesh Perspec�ve

English Surgeon and Histologist Sir William 
Bowan, 1st Baronet (July 20, 1816 - March 29, 
1892) who discovered that urine is a byproduct of 
the blood filtra�on that is carried on the kidney. 
The word kidney is probably a compound of the 
old English cwiα ‘womb’ and ey, ‘egg’ describing 
the organ’s shape. 

Kidneys are a pair of organs located in the right 
and le� side of the abdomen. Human kidneys are 
shaped like large beans and this is where the 
“Kidney Bean” a common red colored bean, gets 
its name. The organs called kidneys are vital to 
life, as they filter bad stuff from blood, help body 
get rid of waste, regulate blood pressure and 
even produce hormones.

Chronic kidney disease (CKD) is gradually and 
progressively increasing public health concern 
among healthcare providers worldwide. CKD 
which affects more than 10% of the world’s 
popula�on has become a global public health 
crisis in recent decades. The declara�on of 
‘World Kidney Day’ and its annual observance 
remained us that CKD is common and harmful for 
almost all cross sec�on of people.1 CKD is 
characterized by progressive decline of renal 
func�on over three months or more, which is 
linked to a number of risk factors. Once the 
kidneys have been damaged, they are unable to 
filter blood or perform other func�ons, resul�ng 
in a decrease in glomerular filtra�on rate (GFR) 
and proteinuria, which can develop to end-stage 
renal Disease (ESRD) or kidney failure. If not 
treated with dialysis or a kidney transplant, ESRD 
is deadly and irreversible.2

CKD is a silent disease which is treated as one of 
the leading causes of death worldwide; many 
developed countries have studied CKD 
awareness and developed guidelines and 

educa�onal programs accordingly. Educa�on to 
improve knowledge on CKD has been 
documented to play an important role in reducing 
this par�cular problem regardless of whether it is 
primary, secondary or ter�ary preven�on.3  
Varied risk factors have been reported in the 
awareness study on chronic kidney disease in 
different countries.

Bangladesh being a densely populated developing 
country, its health care budget is only 1.4% of 
gross na�onal product (GNP) with the priority 
areas as popula�on control, provision of clean 
drinking water and eradica�on of communicable 
disease. The treatment of non-communicable 
disease like chronic kidney disease (CKD) has low 
priority in Bangladesh because of government 
health policy and high cost of treatment.4 
Development of awareness through screening 
and educa�onal programs is s�ll in the stage of 
infancy. The important causes of CKD leading to 
kidney failure in South Asian region are chronic 
glomerulonephri�s, diabetes and hypertension.4 
In Bangladesh, leading causes of ESRD are chronic 
glomerulonephri�s (40%) diabetes (34%) and 
hypertension (15%).5 Pa�ents are not aware of 
the importance of good control of these risk 
factors. Survey in a few rural, urban, 
disadvantageous popula�on suggested that 18 
million people have been suffering from CKD as 
defined by kidney disease outcomes quality 
ini�a�ve (KDOQI) in Bangladesh.5 About 30,000 
pa�ents are reaching end-stage renal failure 
every year in this country they need either dialysis 
or transplanta�on of kidney.5 Out of 18% kidney 
pa�ents, 11% have milder to severe form of 
kidney failure.5 Increased CKD awareness over 
�me in different countries and a recent increase 
in nephrology referrals suggested that these 
efforts may have some posi�ve impact.6-8
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It has been observed that physicians other than 
nephrologists are less likely to recognize CKD and 
some�mes differ in their clinical evalua�on of 
CKD.9 A significant number of CKD pa�ents are 
referred to nephrologists much later than it 
would have been appropriate.10 Late evalua�on 
of CKD pa�ents by nephrologists, especially those 
presen�ng in End-Stage Renal Disease (ESRD) is 
associated with subop�mal pre-dialysis care and 
treatment which ul�mately increases 
mortality.10-12

CKD is also associated with a significant financial 
burden, accoun�ng for more than 2-3% of annual 
healthcare expenditures in high-income 
countries, despite the fact that pa�ents with 
ESRD account for only 0.03% of the total 
popula�on and lower socioeconomic status is 
linked to a higher risk of ESRD.13 The burden of 
CKD in developing countries is substan�ally 
greater due to addi�onal hazards associated with 
poverty, such as infec�ons, hazardous job, 
inadequate educa�on and poor maternal health, 
as well as the addi�onal expense of screening and 
treatment, which must be paid directly by 
pa�ents.14,15

The public awareness and understanding of CKD 
is a cri�cal aspect in CKD preven�ve and 
screening programs’ success, whereby early 
detec�on and management of CKD can help 
prevent disease progression in its early stages.16 
Despite this, the majority of CKD cases are not 
detected early.17 General knowledge of CKD, its 
risk factors and individual risk and CKD status 
consequence and understanding are all parts of 
CKD awareness among pa�ents.18

A be�er rate of early iden�fica�on of those with 
undetected/early CKD or those at risk of 
developing CKD may be a�ainable in popula�ons 

with high levels of knowledge and awareness 
about CKD.19 According to research conducted in 
both developed and developing na�ons, the 
public’s understanding of CKD and its risk factors 
is inadequate.20

Finally it may be men�oned that to explore the 
awareness regarding CKD among the popula�on 
of Bangladesh, inadequate knowledge of CKD and 
significant gaps in awareness of CKD were 
observed in mass popula�ons. Therefore, 
responsible organiza�ons should make an extra 
effort to raise community awareness and 
implement targeted CKD educa�onal ac�vi�es to 
improve the early detec�on and management of 
CKD.
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